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1. Answer to Query on Genealogy. 

Y. wrote: 

I have a question for you I have native american blood in me a 
few 

different tribes and with discovering I had jewish liniage on 
both 

sides my mother's line leads to the priestly line. I come from 
the 

royal families of Germany Scotland Wales Ireland Spain 
England Britain 

france Rome turkey rusia and the Netherlands there are those 
who 

 believe the records of the Roman's and royals others reject 
them 

genealogy  languages history and science are my passion 

https://hebraictribes.com/
https://hebrewnations.com/features/no21/3306.html
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outside of 

 torah what are your thoughts on the lost tribes and Judah being 

 confused as one and what is the majority opinion on this I've 
been 

told the lost tribes are only from the middle east to China but 
not 

from the west. I get told that the west is replacement ideology 

imposed by Christians the Saxton invented it and it has no 
truth. 

 
 

Brit-Am Reply: 

A lot of our acquaintances in Brit-Am have some other blood 
such as Amerindians, etc. 

This is also how it was in Biblical Times. In short,  

"If you are in the House you are part of the family!" 

Genealogical Researches are valuable and can supplement 
Brit-Am researches. 

They usually have something to them but they can also at 
times be misleading. 

The Lost Ten Tribes are among Western Peoples. 

They who say they in Asia or Africa are mistaken. 

Replacement Theology claimed that the Christians had 
replaced the Jews as the Chosen People while the Ten Tribes 
had got lost beforehand and did not count.  

Replacement Theology had anti-Jewish overtones. There are 
groups who believe like we do that the Lost Ten Tribes are 
among Western Peoples but they claim the Jews are not part of 
Israel 

but foreign interlopers. This is a form of Replacement 
Theology. 

It is mistaken and malicious. We should keep away from 
people with such ideas UNLESS we can persuade them 
otherwise. Some people however do not want to hear one way 
or the other. The solution is to persist with learning the Bible, 
praying , and studying the truth such as that found in Brit-Am 
writings. 
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HaShem be with you,  

Yair Davidiy 

 
 

^^^^^^^^^^^^^ 

2. Comments to Video Clip 

re 

Yair Davidiy: Ephraim NOT to Convert! 

 

Devin Taylor 

This is Awesome I'm wondering when our People will be able 
to return to our Land Israel ???? ?? I'm excited about this 
opportunity SHALOM ISRAEL ???? 

 

EPHRAYIM LEARNING CENTER 

Awesome 

 
 

OhioIrishman 

The land of Israel needs to restored to the Israelite people, 
according to the Torah where Hashem has given the land to 
Avraham, so the scattered tribes can come back together and 
be in one accord citizen's of the Kingdom of Hashem in the 
land of our forefathers, as of days of old. May Hashem bless 
you and all that you do for the children of Hashem. 

 
 

Millie1nunez  

HalleluYah  

Thank you for this great wisdom. Baruch all Sheddai 

 

Elaine Gray 

You are so right Yair! I enjoyed you coming to the apartment 
we rented in 2013 , on Lloyd George St with Steve Rees and 
Mike Winger. 

 
 

In Spirit and Truth Inc.  

Absolutely agree Mr Yair! Abba God says he will do it. I 
understand that will happen when "David"(son of 
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David)returns to reign in the new Jerusalem. 

 
 

^^^^^^^^^^^^^ 

3. Finnish Parliament has 200 Members Just Like Issachar! 

         

Youtube Logo 

Henrik Ret commented on your video 

        Issachar and the Rabbis. Finland and Switzerland 

         

Henrik Ret 

Issachar are 200 chief Bible tell.. Finland parlament has 200 
chief. 

 
 

The Bible describes the Tribe of Issachar as having 200 
chieftains. Today the Parliament of Finland has 200 Members! 

 

New King James Version 

1-Chronicles 12: 

32 of the sons of Issachar who had understanding of the times, 
to know what Israel ought to do, their chiefs were two 
hundred; and all their brethren were at their command;  

 

Parliament of Finland 

https://www.eduskunta.fi/EN/Pages/default.aspx 

The Finnish Parliament has two hundred members, elected for 
a term of four years. Members belong to parliamentary groups, 
of which there are currently eleven.  

 

^^^^^^^^^^^^^ 

4. New Video Clip. 

Rabbi Avraham Feld: Tribal Unity 

https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=5K0An7E9mw0&t=9s 

Duration: 27.01 minutes 

Each Israelite Tribe has its own  distinctiveness. Everyone has 
something to give. Levi has the gift of instruction. Brit-Am 
also has much to teach. We need to listen to others even if we 
do not agree with everything they say. Together with 

https://www.eduskunta.fi/EN/Pages/default.aspx
https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=5K0An7E9mw0&t=9s
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that  borders and limitations are necessary. The Almighty 
wants us all to express our Tribal Uniqueness and to serve 
HIM. Together with this we also need to strive for unity.  

^^^^^^^^^^^^^ 

5. New Video. 

Rabbi Avraham Feld: Love of Torah, Torah of Love 

https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=uHmY04xILak 

Duration: 11.56 minutes 

Rabbi Avraham Feld quotes sources comparing the 
relationship of Israel to the Torah to that of a bride and groom. 
This has implications for both Judah and the Lost Ten Tribes.  

 

^^^^^^^^^^^^^ 

 

Jacob (aka Israel) Kept the Law of Tithing: Jacob linked his 
tithing to a Return to the House of his Father. We can do the 
same. 

 

Genesis (NIV) 28: 

18 Early the next morning Jacob took the stone he had placed 
under his head and set it up as a pillar and poured oil on top of 
it. 

19 He called that place Bethel, though the city used to be called 
Luz. 

20 Then Jacob made a vow, saying, If God will be with me and 
will watch over me on this journey I am taking and will give 
me food to eat and clothes to wear 

21 so that I return safely to my fathers household, then the 
LORD will be my God 

22 and this stone that I have set up as a pillar will be Gods 
House, and of all that you give me I will give you a tenth. 

 

Malachi 3: 

10 Bring all the tithes into the storehouse, 

That there may be food in My house, 

And try Me now in this, 

Says the LORD of hosts, 

'If I will not open for you the windows of heaven 

https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=uHmY04xILak
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And pour out for you such blessing 

That there will not be room enough to receive it. 

 

Proverbs 3: 

9 Honor the LORD with your wealth 

and with the first of all your produce, 

10 so your barns will be filled with abundance, 

and your vats will burst open with new wine. 

 

http://hebrewnations.com/publications/books/ 

http://www.britam.org/books.html 

Am.html-Brit-http://www.britam.org/contribute 

 http://hebrewnations.com/contributions/offerings.html 

 

Am.html-Brit-org/contributehttp://www.britam. 

http://hebrewnations.com/contributions/offerings.html 

 
 

^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^ 

^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^ 

Yair Davidiy 

https://www.facebook.com/yair.davidiy 

 

^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^ 

Yair Davidiy YouTube Station: Clips Concerning the Lost 
Ten Tribes of Israel 

https://www.youtube.com/user/yairdavidiy 

https://www.youtube.com/c/YairDavidiy 

Videos with Text. 

https://hebrewnations.com/articles/sources/videotext.html 

 

Brit-Am Hebrew-Language Videos 

https://www.youtube.com/channel/UC_nbJ06T71uzdHc5zzJn
Ikw 

 

=============================== 
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If this is a mistake or if for other reasons you wish to be 
unsubscribed please send a message ASAP 

with UNSUSBCRIBE IN THE SUBJECT LINE and also in 
the text section. 

 
 

SUBSCRIBE -  UNSUBSCRIBE 

To subscribe send an e-mail with SUBSCRIBE in the subject 
line. 

To unsubscribe   send an e-mail with UNSUBSCRIBE in the 
subject line. 

Send to: 

yair@britam.org 

If and when unsubscribing please note the e-mail address that 
you were subscribed with. 
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